
e-ISSN: 2319 – 6734     p-ISSN: 2319 – 6726 

 

CERTIFICATE 

It is certify that the paper entitled by “Assessment of the impact of climatic and 
environmental parameters on malaria transmission in the Greater Abidjan region 
using satellite imagery and Google Earth Engine” has been published in International 
Journal of Engineering and Science Invention (IJESI). 
 

 
Your article has been published with following details: 
 
Author's Name: Vassiriki CISSE 

Journal Name: International Journal of Engineering and Science Invention (IJESI) 

Journal Web:  www.ijesi.org 

Journal Type:  Online & Offline 

Review Type:           Peer Review Refereed 

Publication Year: 2025 

Publication Month: April 

Vol No.:  14 

Issue No.:  04 

 

 

 

 

 
Editor-In-Chief  

International Journal of Engineering and Science Invention (IJESI) 

E-mail ID: ijesi@invmails.com 

Web: www.ijesi.org 
 

Impact Factor : 5.96 

UGC Approval Serial Number: 2573 & UGC Journal Number: 43302 

 



e-ISSN: 2319 – 6734     p-ISSN: 2319 – 6726 

 

CERTIFICATE 

It is certify that the paper entitled by “Assessment of the impact of climatic and 
environmental parameters on malaria transmission in the Greater Abidjan region 
using satellite imagery and Google Earth Engine” has been published in International 
Journal of Engineering and Science Invention (IJESI). 
 

 
Your article has been published with following details: 
 
Author's Name: Eric M'moi V. Djagoua 

Journal Name: International Journal of Engineering and Science Invention (IJESI) 

Journal Web:  www.ijesi.org 

Journal Type:  Online & Offline 

Review Type:           Peer Review Refereed 

Publication Year: 2025 

Publication Month: April 

Vol No.:  14 

Issue No.:  04 

 

 

 

 

 
Editor-In-Chief  

International Journal of Engineering and Science Invention (IJESI) 

E-mail ID: ijesi@invmails.com 

Web: www.ijesi.org 
 

Impact Factor : 5.96 

UGC Approval Serial Number: 2573 & UGC Journal Number: 43302 

 



e-ISSN: 2319 – 6734     p-ISSN: 2319 – 6726 

 

CERTIFICATE 

It is certify that the paper entitled by “Assessment of the impact of climatic and 
environmental parameters on malaria transmission in the Greater Abidjan region 
using satellite imagery and Google Earth Engine” has been published in International 
Journal of Engineering and Science Invention (IJESI). 
 

 
Your article has been published with following details: 
 
Author's Name: TIEMELE Jacques André 

Journal Name: International Journal of Engineering and Science Invention (IJESI) 

Journal Web:  www.ijesi.org 

Journal Type:  Online & Offline 

Review Type:           Peer Review Refereed 

Publication Year: 2025 

Publication Month: April 

Vol No.:  14 

Issue No.:  04 

 

 

 

 

 
Editor-In-Chief  

International Journal of Engineering and Science Invention (IJESI) 

E-mail ID: ijesi@invmails.com 

Web: www.ijesi.org 
 

Impact Factor : 5.96 

UGC Approval Serial Number: 2573 & UGC Journal Number: 43302 

 



e-ISSN: 2319 – 6734     p-ISSN: 2319 – 6726 

 

CERTIFICATE 

It is certify that the paper entitled by “Assessment of the impact of climatic and 
environmental parameters on malaria transmission in the Greater Abidjan region 
using satellite imagery and Google Earth Engine” has been published in International 
Journal of Engineering and Science Invention (IJESI). 
 

 
Your article has been published with following details: 
 
Author's Name: Vafoungbe BAMBA 

Journal Name: International Journal of Engineering and Science Invention (IJESI) 

Journal Web:  www.ijesi.org 

Journal Type:  Online & Offline 

Review Type:           Peer Review Refereed 

Publication Year: 2025 

Publication Month: April 

Vol No.:  14 

Issue No.:  04 

 

 

 

 

 
Editor-In-Chief  

International Journal of Engineering and Science Invention (IJESI) 

E-mail ID: ijesi@invmails.com 

Web: www.ijesi.org 
 

Impact Factor : 5.96 

UGC Approval Serial Number: 2573 & UGC Journal Number: 43302 

 



e-ISSN: 2319 – 6734     p-ISSN: 2319 – 6726 

 

CERTIFICATE 

It is certify that the paper entitled by “Assessment of the impact of climatic and 
environmental parameters on malaria transmission in the Greater Abidjan region 
using satellite imagery and Google Earth Engine” has been published in International 
Journal of Engineering and Science Invention (IJESI). 
 

 
Your article has been published with following details: 
 
Author's Name: Konan Anicet DJE 

Journal Name: International Journal of Engineering and Science Invention (IJESI) 

Journal Web:  www.ijesi.org 

Journal Type:  Online & Offline 

Review Type:           Peer Review Refereed 

Publication Year: 2025 

Publication Month: April 

Vol No.:  14 

Issue No.:  04 

 

 

 

 

 
Editor-In-Chief  

International Journal of Engineering and Science Invention (IJESI) 

E-mail ID: ijesi@invmails.com 

Web: www.ijesi.org 
 

Impact Factor : 5.96 

UGC Approval Serial Number: 2573 & UGC Journal Number: 43302 

 



e-ISSN: 2319 – 6734     p-ISSN: 2319 – 6726 

 

CERTIFICATE 

It is certify that the paper entitled by “Assessment of the impact of climatic and 
environmental parameters on malaria transmission in the Greater Abidjan region 
using satellite imagery and Google Earth Engine” has been published in International 
Journal of Engineering and Science Invention (IJESI). 
 

 
Your article has been published with following details: 
 
Author's Name: Mamadou DIARRA 

Journal Name: International Journal of Engineering and Science Invention (IJESI) 

Journal Web:  www.ijesi.org 

Journal Type:  Online & Offline 

Review Type:           Peer Review Refereed 

Publication Year: 2025 

Publication Month: April 

Vol No.:  14 

Issue No.:  04 

 

 

 

 

 
Editor-In-Chief  

International Journal of Engineering and Science Invention (IJESI) 

E-mail ID: ijesi@invmails.com 

Web: www.ijesi.org 
 

Impact Factor : 5.96 

UGC Approval Serial Number: 2573 & UGC Journal Number: 43302 

 



e-ISSN: 2319 – 6734     p-ISSN: 2319 – 6726 

 

CERTIFICATE 

It is certify that the paper entitled by “Assessment of the impact of climatic and 
environmental parameters on malaria transmission in the Greater Abidjan region 
using satellite imagery and Google Earth Engine” has been published in International 
Journal of Engineering and Science Invention (IJESI). 
 

 
Your article has been published with following details: 
 
Author's Name: Brou Médard KOUASSI 

Journal Name: International Journal of Engineering and Science Invention (IJESI) 

Journal Web:  www.ijesi.org 

Journal Type:  Online & Offline 

Review Type:           Peer Review Refereed 

Publication Year: 2025 

Publication Month: April 

Vol No.:  14 

Issue No.:  04 

 

 

 

 

 
Editor-In-Chief  

International Journal of Engineering and Science Invention (IJESI) 

E-mail ID: ijesi@invmails.com 

Web: www.ijesi.org 
 

Impact Factor : 5.96 

UGC Approval Serial Number: 2573 & UGC Journal Number: 43302 

 


